(Summary Published in the Rose Hill Reporter on April Sth, 2026)

ORDINANCENO. . 744

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF ROSE HILL, KANSAS, AMENDING CHAPTER VII
(“FIRE”), ARTICLE 1 (“FIRE PREVENTION”) OF THE ROSE HILL CODE TO ADOPT THE
2024 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE (IFC), AS PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE
SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS;
PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES; REPEALING
ORDINANCE 709 AND ALL OTHER CONFLICTED ORDINANCES AND REPLACING IT
WITH THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AS HEREIN AMENDED.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF ROSE HILL, KANSAS:

SECTION 1. Adoption of International Fire Code.
Section 7-101 of the code of the City of Rose Hill is hereby amended to read as follows:

7-101. International Fire Code Incorporated. The 2024 Edition of the International Fire
Code (IFC), as published by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference
for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and
property from fire, explosion, or dangerous conditions within the City of Rose Hill, Kansas
subject to the local amendments set forth herein.

SECTION 2. Official Copy.
Section 7-101 of the code of the City of Rose Hill is hereby amended to read as follows:

7-102. Official Copy. Not less than one (1) copy of the International Fire Code incorporated
by reference as amended shall be filed with the City Clerk. Such copy shall be marked or
stamped, “Official Copy as incorporated by Ordinance No. 744 ” with all section or portions
thereof intended to be omitted clearly marked to show any such omissions and all
provisions changing or adding to the incorporated provisions shall be clearly marked or
inserted. Such copy shall have attached a copy of this article and shall be open to
inspection and available to the public during all reasonable business hours.

SECTION 3. Amendments.

Section 7-103 of the code of the City of Rose Hillis hereby amended to read as follows:



)IH @80y 40 AN 81 J0 89P0 31 J0 | 9101y Al 4erdeyg ul
U140} 195 SE 8p0D Suiquinid NIH 9s0Y J0 A1 1U81INd 8y} UBaLl 01 PanJisuod a4 1eys ,2pod
SuIquINg JeUOIIBUISIUY, WIBY 83U} ‘OPOD a1l 81 Ul PSN JBASUBYM "Sulquinid 9°27201

IIH 850y 40 A1ID 8Y1 J0 8POD BUL JO | 8)91UY Al J91deyD Ul yuoy
189S SE 9P0J) 1EDIUBYDDIA 1)IH ©50Y JO A11D 1U81IND 3y} UBaLL 0] PaNJIsU0d 84 11eys ,2poo
1EDIUB DD |BUONBUISIU|, W.B1 3U] ‘@P0D ll4 8} Ul PaSN JSASUBYAA BDIUBYIBN §°L7C0L

“)1IH 9504 40 A}D 4O 9P0OD 8Y1 JO | 9101y Al 4181deyD ul
U110} 195 SB 8p0)) SBL) 18N4 10 Juiquinid 1IIH 89S0y 40 A1ID 1US4IND 8y} UBSW 01 paniisuod aq
JIBUS ,.2P0D) SBO 8N4 1euUOieuIalU], Wd) 841 ‘9p0D a1i4 Y} Ul Pasn JOASUSYAA SED 17°L7C0L

1lIH 850y 40 A11D BU1 JO BPOD Y3 4O | 8101y
Al 181deyD ul Y110y 18s Sk 8poD) 1801110913 )IH 8S0Y 40 A1D 1US1IND BY3 UBSLU 0} PaNiISUod
aq 11eysS :2p0oD 1821119813 D), Wis1 Y1 ‘9p0Y alld SY1 Ul POSN JAASUBYM 182110813 €°L7C01

:SMO)]0} SE pEal 01 papuawie aq J|eys SPIEpPUEIS pue S8po) padualaysy L 20l

O xipuaddy
N Xipuaddy
y xipuaddy
[ xipuaddy

| Xipuaddy
H xipuaddy
o xipuaddy
4 xipuaddy
J xipuaddy
g xipuaddy
D Xipuaddy
g Xipuaddy

-pardope aq 10U 1eYs SI8Y1o )Y "8oualiajel Ag pajeiodiooul
pue paidope aie 4| 8yl ul pauleiuod soolpuadde uimono) ey ‘seolpuaddy L'Z LOL

:SMO]]0) Sk peal 01 papuswe agieys “sao!pueddv L€ LOL,

-apo9 siyy,, 10 ,.D4l, 8U1 /2P0 ail},, B} SE 01 PaLIDjal 1leUIBIDY SESUB)
)1H 950y 40 AID aU1 Jo 8po2) B4 BY) SB UMOUY| 87 |BYS Suole|ngal asayl "enil L "LoL

:SMO]]04 SE peal 0] papuawie 8q11eys (3111 L L0L»

:SMO0J|0} SE papuawie aq J1eys ulalay LQL-/ Uonoasg
u1 99uaIa)al Ag paieiodiooul ‘FZ0g ‘@poD @ii4 1eUOlBUISIU| 8L "SIUSWPUBWY "E0L-L



102.7.7 Residential. Whenever used in the Fire Code, the term “International Residential
Code: shall be construed to mean the current City of Rose Hill Residential Code as set
forth in Chapter IV Article 1 of the Code of the City of Rose Hill.

102.7.8 Building Code. Whenever used in the Fire Code, the term “International Building
Code: shall be construed to mean the current City of Rose Hill Building Code or Existing
Building Codes as set forth in Chapter IV Article 1 of the Code of the City of Rose Hill.

102.7.9 Property Maintenance. Whenever used in the Fire Code, the term “International
Property Maintenance Code” shall be constructed to mean the current City of Rose Hill
Property Maintenance Code as set forth in Chapter IV Article 1 of the Code of the City of
Rose Hill.

102.7.10 Existing Building. Whenever used in the Fire Code, the term “International
Existing Building Code: shall be construed to mean the current City of Rose Hill Existing
Building Code as set forth in Chapter IV Article 1 of the Code of the City of Rose Hill.

“103.2 Appointment” shall be amended to read as follows:

103.2 Appointment. The Fire Code Official of the jurisdiction shall be appointed by the City
of Rose Hill.

“105.1.1 Permits required” shall be amended to read as follows:

105.1.1 Permits required. A property owner or authorized agent who intends to conduct an
operation or business or install or modify systems and equipment that are regulated by this
code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall make application to the City of Rose Hill
and obtain the required permit. Issued permits shall be kept on the premises designated
therein at all times and shall be readily available for inspection by the Fire Code Official. In
instances where laws or regulations are enforceable by departments other than the fire
department, joint approval of the permit shall be obtained from all additional or necessary
departments concerned.

“105.5.36 Open burning” shall be amended to read as follows:

105.5.36 Open burning. An operational permit is required for the kindling or maintaining of
an open fire or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or private ground. This
includes fires in approved containers, incinerators, destructors, or those devices identified
and approved by the Fire Code Official or designee within the jurisdiction. Instructions and
stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to.

Exception: Recreational Fires

“Section 108-Fees” shall be amended to read as follows:

3



‘pauing aq Aew ssaippe jutiad ayi je a1is-uo umo.3

uonelagan QluQ "pauqgiyold siysiqgni pue Jequin) paysiul ‘sane9) -onseld Yaded se yons
syonpoJd uiuing ‘pauing aq Aew sdiyo poom pue ‘squin ‘poomally AjluQ "1eIollO @poD
all4 ay1 Aq panoidde asimIay10 SS9)UN 18SUNS 01 8SHIUNS JO SINOY B} Usamiaq palonpuod
aq 11eys Suiuing uadQ -uolENnlis 81qeuo3oafqo o snoplezey e 01 Sppe Jo $918819 guiuing
uado 1ey Jl Juswiiedap ai1j 8yl Aq 1o Jap)oy Huwlad ayl Ag 8uiuing uado Jo uawWysIN3uixa
a1 Japlo 01 paziioyine sieIoiQ 9pod all4 8y L ‘pa1giyold aq )eys ‘snopJlezey sallj yons
9>ELU S9OURISWINDIID 1290] JO SUONIPUOD d11aYdsoule uaym 10 SUOISSIWS 10po 10 2»oWs 4o
asnesaq a)qeuonoalqo 1o 8AIsuao siieyl Juiuing uadQ ‘Butuing uado pauqiyoid L' L L0E
“SMO1]0J SE peal 01 papusLue ag 1eys Sutuing uado payqiyoid L°L°L0E,

-5892180 JO SuBaW ay1 JO S1uBUOdUW0D JaY10 10 SISIXa ‘sAemilels ‘sIoplliod ‘sogessed ‘sajsie
Jo @sn ay1 apaduwil 10 19n418q0o Aew 141 SUOED0) Ul guipuels 1o/pue 8unys (s)uosiad o1 anp
s1uednoo0 a8y Jo A1ejes ay1 01 S1S[Xa 1BaIY] B 181 SaU|LLLIS18p 1.0 8P0D all4 UaymJo
“1e1211J0 8p0oD ali4 @y Ag peisod 10 paziioyine uaag sAey Uel} Joaisayl uonJod lo ainyonns
‘Buip)ing e ul 91doad aJow aie 219yl 19U UBYM S1SIX8 1EY1 UONIPUOD “BUIPMOIDIBAD L

'SMO))0} SE peal 01 popUaWE Bq ]BYS ,Suoiiuljaq 1elauan-gozg Uonoss,,

‘Sulieay ay1 alojaq shep Q| 1sea) je wuepadde syl 011uss
aq ))eys SuleaH 2y 10 81Q 2Y1 JO 82[10U puE SULieay 8yl 104 81Ep B SUILLI9ISP
qeaddy j0 20110N Jo 1d1aoay jo sAe Og ulyum Meys Apog 8utulanog ay) (o

‘Junum uljeadde yons jo Apoq
Su|u1an08 ay1 Ajliou Neys a0 A1) ayr qeaddy Jo 90110N YoNs JO 1digoas uodn (g

1910 AHD U1 O 99110 3Y1 Yum paly g jeys jeadde
10) uoieondde Jo 9210U YONG 192140 SUIDI0JUS 8] L0} UOISIO8p 8yl JO aonou
Suiaieoal 1aye sAep 01 uiylim Apog SuiLIaA0g 8yl 81ojaq guiieoH ei1sanbas (e

:)leys apo9 211} 9Y3 Jo uolsioap syl jeadde 01 sal1sap oym uoneiodios Jo iy ‘uosied

Auy “1BI01140 9POD) ail4 8Y1 JO SUOIEUIWLISLSP 10 SUOISIDap ‘sioplo Jo s\eadde 8yl ieay

pue malnai 01 Alioyine aAey 1eys ||IH 8soy J0 K119 ay1 Jo Apog 8ululanos) ayl ‘9pod siyl Jo
uonejaidiaiul pue uoneondde 8yl 01 9AlIR)AI |BIDIHO 8POD 8dld BYI 10 Jamainal ueyd syl Aq
SUOJ3EU|WIB1ap 10 SUOISIOaP ‘s19pJo Jo sjeadde apioap pue Jesy 01 1aplo U] eisusy 2601

:SMO]104 SE peaJ 0] papuawe aq eys .Sjeadde jo pieogq 60L,,

-Apog BUIUI2A0S) 8Y} JO uo1IN0say Aq

DI} 0] SN WOJ) PASIAL 8 ||eys pue A1essadau palwlsap Se pasinal pue MaIAal O} 103lgns
aq Aew saa) asay] 8pod 11IH 8S0Y 81 JO ¢06-L UohI38§ 01 juensind )14 @soy jo A1D 8yl
0 Apog Suiulsno9g ayi Jo uonnjosay Agq paysiigqelisa aq 1eys sas} ywiad al4 ‘seed L'80L



Exception: Prescribed burning for the purpose of reducing the impact of wildland fire when
authorized by the Fire Code Official.

“307.2 Permit required” shall be amended to read as follows:

307.2 Permitrequired. A permit shall be obtained from the Fire Code Official in
accordance with Section 105.5.36 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or
range or wildlife management practices, open burning, use of an incinerator or destructor,
prevention or control of disease or pests, or a bonfire. Application for such approval shall
only be presented by and permits issued to the owner, or designee of the owner, of the land
upon which the fire is to be kindled. Burn permitinstructions and stipulations of the permit
shall be adhered to.

#307.4 Location” shall be amended to read as follows:

307.4 Location. The location for open burning shall not be less than 50 feet (15.24 m) from
any property line, structure, or roadway, nor within two (2) miles of any airport or flyway,
unless otherwise approved by the Fire Code Official, and provisions shall be made to
prevent the fire from spreading to within 50 feet (15,240 mm) of any structure or property
line.

Exceptions:

1. Firesin approved containers that are not less than 15 feet *4,572 mm) from a
structure with a fuel stack size of 3 feet (914 mm) or less in diameter and 2 feet (610
mm) or less in height (i.e., outdoor fireplaces).

2. The minimum required distance from a structure shall be 25 feet (7,620 mm) when
the pile size is 3 feet (914 mm) or less in diameter and 2 feet (610 mm) or less in
height (i.e., recreational fires).

“307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces” shall be amended as follows:

307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in
accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and shall not be operated within 15 feet
(3048 mm) of a structure or combustible material. The following requirements shall be
met:

1. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be placed on a non-combustible surface and shall
not be used on balconies or wood decks.

2. Portable outdoor fireplace use shall be discontinued when there is a ban or
moratorium on burning issued by federal, state or local agencies.

3. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall not be used when the wind speed is in excess of 15
mph.



“eID1}JO @p0D 8l 8yl Aq panoidde
alaym (WW 0Z/‘GY) 1891 0G L paadxe 01 pailiwliad ad jjeys aoueisip syl :uondaoxyg

‘U0110aUUOD a10Wal
ay1 01188 G Uy} 189S0 oU aq J1eys 1uelpAy paiinbal ay] "ainionis ayi o} (WwwzeL‘zL) 109
Of UBY} 18S010 OU aq 11eys ueipAy palinbal syl "uoilosuuod uswilledap alll 8yl Jo (wiwi
0Z.°St) 1994 0G L UMM 1uelpAy a1 B 8ARY 1BYS G06 U0109S YliM 80UBPIOdDE Ul paljelsul
‘SLOI}D9ULOD 210Wal 10 ‘WalsAs Japjulids ‘edidpuels SulAles SUOI108UU0D 1uawipiedap

a1} yum paddinba Suipjing ‘suonoauuod Juswedsp ally 10y SIUBIPAH L°L°G°L0S

1SAOY|04

Se peal 0] papuUsWE aq J]eys ,Suol19auuod Justuliedap aliy 10} sjueIpAH L°L°G°L0S

1E121}10 8p0oD il

a1 Aq paJinbai alaym papinoid aq 1eys sulew pue siuelpAy ailly 81is-uo ‘duipiing o Anioel
5U1 JO 10L81Xa 8y1 punoie ainos panrocidde ue Ag painseaw se ‘peol ss8doe snieledde

ai1} B UO JUBIPAY B WO} (W ZZ 1) 199} 00F UBY] 210W S| U0RDIPSUNl 8Y) UIYIIM 10 01Ul PBAOL
10 pPa19NJIsu0D Ja1ealsy gulpiing Jo Aioe) eyl Jo uollod e a1aypn ‘paJdinbal alaypn L' S 205
:SAAO)0) SB pEal 01 papuaule adg )jeys ,palinbay aiaym L'5"L0G,

1810110 B8P0 |l

ayy Aq palinbal se ss8o0e Alessaoau uled 01 Sop00 1e1SIP 10 S9JIAAP §58008 olu0J10819/sAan)|
UIBIUOD JIBYS puE sesuey )IH 8soy Jo A11D aul 1o} xoq Aax| paroidde Auo ayy si

pueiq xog xouy| 8yl ‘uoneoo) panosdde ue ul pepeisul g 01 xoq Ae e alinbals 03 pazuoyine
S11B191440 9POD a1l 8yl ‘uasaid aie/st 101eAd)a Jo Buipying ongnd e Jo ‘sasodind gunysuyaaly
10 BuIARS-3)1] 10} AIBSS808U S| SS20E 91EIPaLLUI 9Iaym 10 S5UlUado paindas Jo asnedsq
Pa101I1Sal S| BAIR UB 10 8IN1ONIIS B UIUYLIM 10 01 §83008 218U\ "Palinbal a18ypn L'908
:SMO)]0) Se peal 01 papualle aq Jjeys ,paiinbay 218y soxog A3 905,

'S9P09 JIH 2S0Y 40

A11D 1UB1IND Y1IM 80UEBPIOIDE Ul UoNellIgeyal 1o uoniowap Aq paiege pue sjesun palejdap
‘pauopueqge paiapisuod ag eys saiuadoid jusoelpe 03 peaids aJiy 10 2sde)109 1ein1onils Jo
J1o8uep e jussaid yoiym o ‘sesodind jea))i 10y 10 suosiad pazioyine-un Aq paidnaoo usaq
aABY UDIYM ‘painoasun o paisaroidun swooaq A)psleadal io Awuaisisiad yoiym ‘ssalppe
palaisigal 10 umouy| 18] 841 01 Suljlew jo 91edlyl1i8d e Jo yoiedsip Ag paiedo) Jo paijiiuspl aq
10UUEBD JAUMO UB UDIUM 10 sasiliald pue sainioniis ‘sguipying "sasiwaid psuopueqy L°LLE
:SMO1)0) SB pEeal 0} papualle aq ||eYys ,Sasiuald Juedenp LLE,,

‘pamo) e 10U ale ysiqgnu

pue laquin) paysiuly ‘sanea) ‘onsed ‘pieoqpled 9aded se yons s1onpold -eoejdalll
100p1N0 a)genod ay3 ulyim pauing aq Aew sdiyd poom pue ‘squ) ‘poomally AlUO °g

"RoULUIY9/1USA 81 UO Paledo) ‘alim 1e1atl Ag painaas usalos jelswl (ww /2 zL)

Youl 7/, WNUWIXEW B Ylm Joisaliejleds e yim papiroid ssajun ‘Joos 813Ulys eys
Aue Jo (Www 0oF‘ZGL) 1234 00G Ulylim pasn aq 10U neys saoe)daul) loopino a)genod “f



“606.5 Domestic cooking appliance used in commercial occupancies” shall be added
to read as follows:

606.5 Domestic cooking appliances used in commercial occupancies. Domestic cooking
appliances utilized for purposes incidental to occupancy and not for commercial food
preparation shall be provided with a Type Il hood or domestic hood. The hood shall include
a Guardian Il style fire suppression system as appropriate for the type of appliance and
processes.

“901.4.73 Environment” shall be amended to read as follows:

9101.4.7.3 Environment. Automatic sprinkler system riser rooms and fire pump rooms
shall be maintained at a temperature of not less than 40 degrees Fahrenheit. Heating units
shall be permanently installed (non-switched). Exterior riser rooms shall have low-
temperature detection connected to the fire alarm system.

“903.2.1.2 Group A-2” shall be amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided thought stories
containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories of GroupA-2 occupancy to
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where on the following
conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).
2. Thefire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

Exception: The fire area occupant load may increase to 299 if a 3" exit, in accordance with
section 107.1.2 and Section 1016.2 and a manual fire alarm system that activates an
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5, is added. Those
components must be approved by the Fire Code Official and the building official of the
jurisdiction or the plans examiner reviewing the project.

3. Thefire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

“903.2.8 Group R” shall be amended to read as follows:
903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with 903.3
shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area.

Exceptions:

1. One-ortwo-family dwelling unit.

2. Dwelling units in three- and four-family dwellings separated from each other by
wall and/or floor assemblies having not less than 2-hour fire-resistance rating.
Fire resistance-rated floor/ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be
tight against an exterior wall, and wall assemblies shall extend from the
foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing. The roof shall be a minimum
of class C roof covering, and the roof decking or sheathing is of non-combustible

7



8

“wnwixew y -uoneinp awi unysn AousSiawa ay1 Jo pua ay} ie (xn) 9°Q) 8)puUed1004
90°0 J0 1iod Aue 18 Wnwiuiw e pue agelaAe (xn) 9) 8)pued-1004 9°Q 01 2UNI3p

01 paniiwiad aq )1eys S)19A8) UOBUILINY| |9AB) JO0Y} }E SS8133 JO yied ayl suoje
painsealu (xn) ) 8)pueo-1004 0 Jo 1ulod Aue 1 Wwnwiujw e pue (xn L 1) 9)pued-1004
L Jo efelaAr UB UBY) S$S8) 10U S| 1BY] UONEUILLINYI 1BRIUI 9plAold 0} paiduelle aq 11eys
sannoe) Sunysn Aouagiowg Jamod Aouadiowa 1apun jaAa) uoneuilwny 2 g'8001L
:SMO]J0) Se

peal 01 papuawe ag eys Jemod Aouagiawa lapun j2Aa) uoneuiwnyj g°€°8001.,

‘AIp 10 19

194318 S1 11 18Y1 pUE 1ENUEW S| WwalsAs ayl eyl s1edlpul osie jeys udis ayl ‘swolsAs
adidpuels jenuew 104 "ySiay ul (ww 9° Lo L) s8ydul {7 UByl SS8]10U S18118] UM usis
e Aq pe1eugisap aq 11eys (DQ4) uonosuuod uswuedap aily yoe3 “Buene L'S'CL6
:SMO1)0} SE peal 01 papuawe aq J1eys ,sulana L'S'CL 6,

‘g1qeondde

Se Joalayl uoieuiquiod e 1o JdIdaNVLS ANV 4XdSOLNY, HO dXdSOLNY

ANV 3dIdANVYLS, «NOILOIANNOOLSIL, «' SAdIdANVYLS, « SHIDINIHAS OILYWOLNY.
:pealjeys sugis yong ‘suonoauuoo duind alyy o sadidpuels ‘siep|unds

onewolne SUIAIaS SUOJ102UU0D JusWLIedap allj 1B U0 palunow aq )1eys azIs

ur (Ww 9°L0L) SaYoul 7 UBYY SS9 10U S19118] PasIel YIIM ugis |e1ewl v 'sugis G ZLe
:SMO]]0J SE peal 01 papualue adg 1eys ,susiS §'ZL6,

"U011ED0] POPUDNIE AJIUBISUOD B 1B /06 U0I10ag Ul 21amas)a

POMOYE @J8UM 10 “1IUN |0J1U0D LLIBE 811} 8} 1B 82UNOUUE |EYS pUE UONEDIIIoU
wuednoo0 a1eniul 1eYs SWL1sAs uilojuow Japjulids uoilouny paledipap 1o/pue
SWI91SAsS LWIE . 8.1 ‘UoIIBAIIOR UOdM "UOIIEIDUNUUE PUE UOIIBAIDE WLIBYY L'G°L06
:SMO0)]0} SE peal 0] papusLue 8 1|eys ,Uo1BI2UNUUE PUE UOIIBAILOR WIBYY L°G'L06)

*101191X2 2y} wolj paysndwooaoe ag jouued

anosal o Funydiiall 184l Yons JauleLl g ul pa1oniisqo aq 1ou )1eys pue 1011a1xa

ay1 wouy uawiiedap aliy ayy o) papiroid aq ieys gujuado ans 01 S§803Y 1ysiay
ul (Ww §1Z1) Sayoul g7 pue Yipim Ul (Wi g9/) sayoul g Uyl ss8) 10U JO Uoisuslip
WINWIUIW & aABY N1eys sgujuadQ "sse@o9e puk uoisuswip duiuadQ L°L'LL'C'€06

'SMO1|04
Se peal 0] papusLue ad )1eys ,S$sa9oe pue uoisuaip uluadQ L'L'LL'2'E06,

-sandde gLz‘91-ZL V'S Uaym paiinbaljou ale sweisAs ‘g
‘s11un e Inoysgnolyy papiaolid
aq |eys Wwa1sAs Japjuiids o11eLIOINE pUB ‘SHUN UBde[pE MO]3Q 10 BAOGE paguelie
ale ‘Joatay] suoiniod Jo ‘sSuipiing a1aypn “8ulyiesys 40 308p PO0l 81 JO BaIE SILL
ygnoJyl suonellauad ou aq11eYs 818yl "S)BM 10 S]|EM BY1 JO BPIS jOES UO (ww
61ZL) 199} ¢ JO 80URISIP B 10} POOM palean-luepielal-ally paroidde Jo sjelalew



to-minimum illumination uniformity ratio of 40 to 1 shall not be exceeded. In Group
I-2 occupancies, failure of single lamp in a luminaire shall not reduce the
illumination level to less than 0.2 footcandle (2.2 lux). Emergency lighting fixtures
shall be arranged at intervals not to exceed 50 feet (15 240 mm) on center.

Exception: Maneuvering clearances are not required for doors to exit stairways for
levels above the level of exit discharge where the exit enclosure does not include an
area of refuge.

“1012.1 Scope” shall be amended to read as follows:
1012.1 Scope. The provisions of this section shall apply to ramps used as a
component of means of egress.

Exceptions:

1. Ramped aisles within assembly rooms or spaces shall comply with the
provisions of Section 1030.

2. Curb ramps shall comply with Americans with Disabilities Act Accessihility
Guidelines Sec. 406.1.

3. Vehicle ramps in parking garages for pedestrian exit access shall not be required
to comply with Sections 1012.3 through 1012.10 where they are not an
accessible route serving accessible parking spaces, other required accessible
elements or part of an accessible means of egress.

“Where required” shall be amended to read as follows:

1013.1 Where required. Exits and exit access doors shall be marked by an approved
exit sign readily visible exit signs to clearly indicate the direction of egress travel.
Where the exit or path of egress travel is notimmediately visible to the occupants.
Intervening means of egress doors within exits shall be marked by exit signs. Exit
sign placement shall be such that any point in an exit access corridor or exit
passageway is within 100 feet (30.480 m) or the listed viewing distance of the sign,
whichever is less, from the nearest visible exit sign. Exit signs required at doors
shall not be located more than 12 feet (3658 mm) above the finish floor, nor more
than 2 feet (610 mm) from either edge of door.

Exceptions:
1. Exit signs are not required in rooms or areas that require only one exit or exit
access.

2. Main exterior exit doors or gates that obviously and clearly identifiable as exits
need not have exist signs where approved by the building official.

3. Exitsigns are not required in occupancies in Group U and individual sleeping
units or dwelling units in Group R-1, R-2 or R-3.

4. Exit signs are not required in dayrooms, sleeping rooms or dormitories in
occupancies in Group I-3.



oL

1esiydesfodol se yons ‘sainies) jeoads J0 UOIIBISPISU0D 1a}je eldIO 8podD
all4 ay1 Ag paulwIalap ag eys 1w Ayjoedeo siyl ‘suoieneisul lenotedu) (L
:suondaoxyg

‘papiaold ale sannin ses ongnd alaym suwl A112 ay1 uiyum paugiyold

ale suoyed 00 ueyl Jeleals siauleluo) ‘suoyes g 4o Auoeded Jajem B peaoxa 10U
leys uoneneisul auo Aue jo Ayoeded a1e8als8E Byl ‘seale paisaguoo Jo pajeindod
Riaeay jo uoiloslold ayy 1oy sed wnajoliad payanbi Jo agel01s ay1 unoluisal me) Aq
Paysge1sa sHWI 2yl UIYUAA “SHWI Paysiqelss uiyim Aoeded wWNWIXe 27019

:SMO1|0) Se
peaJ 01 papuswe ag 1jeys Suwi paysigeise uiyum Apoeded wnwixel ¢ yoL 9,
‘AouaBlaLua JO BSeD Ul aoue)lsisse

guLinoas Jo asodind ay1 10) (g) pue ‘Supjied jo aoe)d Syl 1e 1) 119M S| 189118

ay1 1 1yiu 1o Aep ayy Bulinp sjeaw 4oy (g) ‘Suipeojun 1o guipeOo] Yyiim Uo1109UU0D

ui (1) “4o1esedo oy jo oouasqe Jo Supjied 1qiyoid Jou jeys siy| :suoipdaoxy

‘paezey Auadoid Jo a)n e 1uasald 1e1d0 apod

all4 a1 Jo uoluido sy} ul ‘pinom 1ey1 aoe1d Jayio Aue e 1o ‘sl Aue e Ayjioel ai1eo
yyeay Jo eudsoy qeuoieonpa Jo xa)dulod 1810y 1o juswinede ‘eale enuopisal Aue
40 (,00S) 1984 palpuny Al ulylm Aane Jo anuaae “Aemysiy 128118 Aue uo papuaiieun
2191yaA yons aAea) 1o died )jeys ‘sjelialew Suliellll pue spiezey eslpawolq

pue U1)eay ‘SAISOLI0D ‘S1elIa1eW SAI10E0IPE) ‘S]BII81B LI DIX0} PUE JIX0) Ausiy

‘spin)) 01UaZ0AI0 ‘S]BLIS1ELU BAII0BAI 191EM ‘S|ELID1BU BAI30EI 9)1gEISUN “elslew
olloydolAd ‘sapixolad 21ueBIO ‘S19ZIPIX0 ‘SPIj0s a1qewiluey ‘spinbn @1glisnguioo
pue ajgewwe)) ‘sased passaidliod ‘sluage Sulselq pue soAISO|dxa 01 paliwn

1ou 1nq Suipn|aul ‘sjelielewW snoplezey se selouage Aioleindal |e00) 10 81e1s “elapal
Aq panjisse)o s1onpodd Suiueluod 32NnJ1XUE) 10 1ajlel1 »ona qle1 qoq ‘ueA xoq e se
4oNs 9)21Y3aA AI9ANSP 1810J8WLWI0D B Jo J01etado ON “Sublied pspusneun L'y L v00S
:SMO]]0} SE peal 01 papuawe ag 1eys subjied pepuaneun L'y 7005,

‘suolelado aiealdd pue ongnd ayl

0} 9]01SS929E aJ. 1Bl 8S0Y3 Y10q apnjoul jleys suoiieiado 4ong "apod 1edIUBYIIN
1eUOBUISIU| PUB ‘@P0D 18011108)F 1BUONEN ‘@p0] SB jan4 jeuoneulaiu] ‘apoD
guip|ing Jeuoneulalul ayl pue 191deyd siyl Yyim adueploode ul aq eys sogeled
1iedal pue sannioey guisuadsip-1an) 81014 8A-1010W 1jeID1IE ‘S3111I08} guisuadsip
-1any Jo10W 2)21YyaA 189}y ‘saniioe} uisuadsip-1an} Jolow sullew ‘sannioel
Fuisuadsip-1any J010W BAIIOWIOINE ‘SUOIIB]BISUI |BIIUSPISaY '0d0o2S L' LOET
:SMO01)0} SE peal 0} papuawie aq 11eys ,2d0oas L' LOEZ

“fauagiawe ue ul eale Suneas ayl yum Sujuado 1o A10}IoA yoea Ajiuapl

031 8unygdn sse.83 "S81I01WOA syl Woly jusiedde Allpeal ale 12yl 8sIN0OU0D 8yl

ul papiaold aie sugdis Hxe a1aym seale uj1eas o1l s8uiuado 10 SBLI0LIWOA JO 3pIS
guneas ay) uo paiinbaliou aie sudis Ux8 ‘G-Y pue 7Y sdnoJlo ul sapouednooo Ul °g



conditions, nature of occupancy, and proximity to buildings, capacity of
proposed LP-gas containers, degree of fire protection to be provided and
capabilities of the local fire department.

2. Pre-existing installations until said property changes ownership.

3. Storage of portable LP-gas containers awaiting use or resale. See Section 6109.

SECTION 4. The code of the City of Rose Hill is hereby amended by adding a
section which reads as follows:

7-104. Work performed under Permit prior to effective date.

Work being performed under a permitissued prior to the effective date of this
Ordinance may continue under the Code(s) in effect at the time the permit was
issued. Such work must be completed within one year after the effective date of
this Ordinance, unless approval is given for an extension. If the permitis
abandoned or expires, a new permit must be applied for to complete the work, and
all remaining work must comply with this code.

SECTION 5. Enforcement. The code of the City of Rose Hill is hereby amended by
adding a section which reads as follows: Enforcement.

7-105. Enforcement.

The governing body may appoint one or more individuals to serve as Fire Code
Official, in accordance with Section 1-301 of the Rose Hill Code. The provisions of
this Code shall be enforced by the Fire Code Official, who is authorized to:

Conduct inspections

[ssue permits

Enforce compliance

Issue citations or orders as necessary

SECTION 6. Penalties.

The code of the City of Rose Hillis hereby amended by adding a section which
reads as follows:

7-106. Enforcement.

Any person, firm, or corporation who shall fail to comply with any of the
redu]fefnénts"‘ thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation
of the approved construction documents or directive of the Fire Code Official, or of
a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a

' 'misdémé‘a'ho”r, punishable by a fine not more than $2,500.00 or by imprisonment

11



¢l

AN
~ D\ S NHQSHSEN DY GAVNICHO
3H.E"§OA WINNS QLR Y 1STLHW 34030

'aanNoo.trno"!h‘w‘f‘ AIND J1OA TYNIA HLH0
"UHOC)EH:iPl L B0 E40

LNOOISEVAS aVMmo{J!VS AINHOLLY ALID ‘O9IINVIWYS 'V dUVHOIY
=L'|i'0=1J= FONYNIAHD Inlioldl) SHL 0 AdOD LOZWHOD

ANV SNHLY §1 ONIOIFHOH THL L¥HL AdI1E30 ABTE3H |
S T

‘WHO4 OL SV d3aA0dddY

: S Rx
- AJ_ID V% EI/&)K]"IEI)I

\kal// // / Wy

1
\/' " /
1S3V
C Alp‘é]‘ﬁ%l'fét;zavas
(O HOAVIN ‘ZLNVHOS ININYAM & & i <%
TRt ( YT A F9, 57 ¢
. "'r,; & 40 ‘_\‘\"‘
SYSNYM “T1IH 3S0H 40 ALID

LTI

| _
‘920z * Cﬂ{ [70s0 hep W uo gIAOYddY ANY 31dOaV ‘a3ssvd
g ; g

/00E-Z L "V¥'S™ 011uensind uaIolyns pue ajeinooe Ajese) se Aauiony AD
ay1 Aq palyiiao Alewiwins e jo sadedsmau A1 1e191JJ0 83 Ul 82U0o uoneongnd pue
10AB A 241 A 18ncidde 1D aul Jo Apoq Buluianog ayi Ag uondope sil 18}je pue woly
90104 )N} Ul 8 PUB 108}}8 831 1|BYS 22UBUIDIO SIYL "8ie( 8A11084F "6 NOILLD3S

“1SIXd
$101)JU0D YoNS 18U 1USIXa 8} 01 pajeadal Agaiay ale Sul03a.10) a1 UM J0[)juod

Ul sesuey| “IIH 8oy 40 A1 9Y3 Jo seoueulpiQ lold 1y “iejeadsy '8 Noﬁggs

‘ap0D 10 a2UBUIPIO
siy1 Jo suoniod Bululewad syl Jo Alphea ayl 198 10U 1jeys UOISId8p Yyons

JeuoiINyiisuooun ag 01 pjay ‘uoseal Aue 104 ‘st apod ayi Jo 10 adUBUIPIO SIUI IO
aselyd 10 8sNe)D ‘9oudluUas ‘U0NN0dS-gns ‘U01109s Aue | “faniqelanas “/ NOILD3S

"9SUBL0
ojeiedas e pawaap aq J1eYs POAIS U9ag Sey 99110U 8NP 1918 S8NUIIU0D UORE|OIA

e 1ey1 Aep yoeg “JuswuosHdWl pue aull yons yiog 1o 4ead suo SUipasoxs 1ou



